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3.7 STANDARD AND NON-STANDARD PAY ITEMS 
The design of TCD plan sets will consist of pay items that are to be included in the 
Summary of Quantities sheet. Summary of Quantities sheets will be required for each 
construction plan set that is being prepared, (e.g. Signing plan set, Pavement Marking 
plan set, Traffic Signal plan set, etc.). When a plan set is prepared primarily for one 
TCD such as a traffic signal(s) and there are other incidental TCDs which supplement 
the plan set, then only one Summary of Quantities sheet is required. An example of this 
situation is where a traffic signal plan set is being prepared and signs and lighting are 
included within the intersection and are incidental to the traffic signal design. 
 
Pay items will be shown in tabular form and must be identified on the Summary of 
Quantities sheet exactly as noted in the Standard and Non-Standard pay item listings. 
These pay item listing are available online as noted below. 
 
Standard pay items are pay items that are identified in the VDOT Road and Bridge 
Specifications. Standard pay items are supported in TRNS-PORT, whereby the unit cost 
estimate for the pay item is provided within TRNS-PORT. Standard pay items are 
available online at: 
 

http://www.virginiadot.org/business/const/default.asp 
 
 
Non-Standard pay items are pay items that are not identified in the VDOT Road and 
Bridge Specifications. A Non-Standard pay item may require support by a Special 
Provision or Special Provision Copied Note. Non-Standard pay items require unit cost 
estimates to be provided within TRNS-PORT. Non-Standard pay items are available 
online at: 
 

http://www.virginiadot.org/business/const/default.asp 

3.8 SPECIAL PROVISIONS, SPECIAL PROVISION COPIED NOTES AND OTHER 
CONTRACT ELEMENTS 

A VDOT contract is the governing document for project construction. A contract 
package consists of several elements, which have order and hierarchy of which are 
identified in VDOT Road and Bridge Specifications Section 105.05 and briefly described 
below: 


